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California Science and Technology University (CSTU) is a 
student-centered and career-oriented university that provides 
quality education in cutting-edge technologies and modern 
management science.

CSTU is conveniently located in Silicon Valley, the technology 
center of the United States which provides ample employment 
opportunities for our graduates.  To meet the high demand of the 
job market in Silicon Valley, CSTU focuses on Computer Science 
and Business Administration. Students can enroll in the Master of 
Science in Computer Systems and Engineering (MSCSE) or Master 
of Business Administration (MBA) in Data Science degree 
program.

International students will be granted a work permit（OPT) for 
three years after graduation.  Those with children will be able to 
attend a public school free of charge.  Silicon Valley’s diverse 
culture provides a friendly environment for international students 
to settle in.  If you are interested in building a career in Silicon 
Valley,  studying at CSTU is a perfect starting point!

CSTU Introduction

International Student Benefits



CSTU
The right university for you

High Job Placement Rate

Up-to-Date Courses 

Student-Centered Learning 

Cost-Effective Programs

High Job Placement Rate
CSTU distinguishes itself from traditional universities with a 
curriculum that is closely related to the job market.  All professors 
at CSTU have extensive industrial experience, and CSTU’s 
curriculum is updated every year according to market trends. 
CSTU also partners with many companies to provide internships to 
enhance students' working experience.  Benefiting from the 
practical curriculum, geographical advantages, and corporate 
partnership, the employment rate of CSTU graduates is far above 
the average of US universities.  For career-minded students, CSTU 
is an ideal choice for you!

Up-to-Date Courses 
The latest technology is based on artificial intelligence, and modern 
management relies on data.  CSTU’s MSCSE focuses on artificial 
intelligence, and its MBA focuses on data science.  To learn 
cutting-edge technologies and modern management science, 
CSTU is the right place for you!



MBA in Data Science

MSCSE

CSTU is a student-centered private university where each student 
gets special attention in our small class environment.  The recent 
student survey by the accreditation agency shows students' 
overall satisfaction exceeded 98%.  Our student-centered learning 
policy ensures a high student satisfaction rate. CSTU also offers 
special scholarships for students' future learning after their 
graduation.  Learning at CSTU is a lifetime benefit!

Our high efficiency enables us to provide high-quality teaching at 
lower tuition compared to that of public universities.  For students 
with a family, your children are eligible to attend top K-12 public 
schools for free.  It’s a cost-effective choice for your family to get 
high quality education in Silicon Valley.  To upgrade your career and 
change your life, come to Silicon Valley and join us at CSTU! 

Student-Centered Learning 

Cost-Effective Programs

Digital Marketing

Product Management

Fintech and Applications 

High-tech Project Management

Statistics Analysis and BA

Big Data and Data Engineering

Full Stack Applications

Cloud Computing and Internet Security

Artificial Intelligence

Machine Learning and Deep Learning

Degree Programs
Core courses for each major



How to apply to CSTU?

Application

Contact Us
admission@cstu.edu, +1 (408) 400 - 3948

1601 McCarthy Boulevard
Milpitas, CA 95035

www.cstu.edu

Apply Now!

High Pro�le Companies in Silicon Valley


